
 

Sample Social Media Posts | Baby Bonds  

Post #1  
IMAGES: ‘What are Baby Bonds?’ Carousel   

Facebook/LinkedIn  
Copy: Did you know the Baby Bonds initiative could help every child in New Mexico build a 
brighter future? This innovative program provides a financial foundation for young adults to 
invest in their education, purchase a home, entrepreneurship, or retirement planning. Let’s work 
together to close the wealth gap and create opportunities for all! 
 
Learn more about Baby Bonds and how you can support this transformative initiative: 
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm  

Instagram  
Copy: Did you know the Baby Bonds initiative could help every child in New Mexico build a 
brighter future? This innovative program provides a financial foundation for young adults to 
invest in their education, start a business, or buy a home. Let’s work together to close the wealth 
gap and create opportunities for all! 
 
Learn more about Baby Bonds and how you can support this transformative initiative by visiting 
the link in our bio.  
 
#BabyBondsNM #NewMexicoBabyBonds #SupportNMBabyBonds  
 

X/Bluesky 
Copy: #BabyBonds can help every child in #NewMexico build a brighter future! 💰 This 
program gives young adults a financial foundation to invest in education, start a business, or 
buy a home. Let’s close the wealth gap together! Learn more: https://bit.ly/babybondsnm 
 
 
 
 

https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1ewScAGR-Z2w9i4r4T0oJgbaXUripZH0p?usp=sharing
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm


 

Post #2 
IMAGE: Opportunity to Dream 1 

Facebook/LinkedIn  
Copy: A brighter future starts here! The Baby Bonds initiative is a game-changer for New 
Mexico, ensuring every child has the resources to succeed as an adult. Imagine what your 
support can do for the next generation. Let’s close the wealth gap and invest in our kids! 💡 
 
Find out the latest on the initiative’s progress and how you can help: https://bit.ly/babybondsnm  

Instagram  
Copy: A brighter future starts here! The Baby Bonds initiative is a game-changer for New 
Mexico, ensuring every child has the resources to succeed as an adult. Imagine what your 
support can do for the next generation. Let’s close the wealth gap and invest in our kids! 💡 
 
Find out the latest on the initiative’s progress and how you can help using the link in our bio.  
 
#BabyBondsNM #NewMexicoBabyBonds #SupportNMBabyBonds  
 

X/Bluesky 
Copy: A brighter future starts here! 🌟 The #BabyBonds initiative ensures every child in 
#NewMexico has the resources to succeed. Let’s close the wealth gap and invest in our kids! 
💰 Learn how you can help: https://bit.ly/babybondsnm  
 

Post #3 
IMAGE: Opportunity to Grow 1 

Facebook/LinkedIn  
Copy: At [Organization Name], we’re proud to support the Baby Bonds initiative—a policy that 
empowers every child in New Mexico with a financial foundation for their future. This innovative 
program can help young adults invest in education, homeownership, or entrepreneurship, 
creating generational change across our state. Let’s work together to make this vision a reality!​
 

https://drive.google.com/file/d/1jfXQbXWWHfFZBpjyj8KZz26M71seHT6S/view?usp=sharing
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1EZPwg_AGrG3jyPSfa8fRcHXb7Jw8Z69D/view?usp=drive_link


 
Learn more about Baby Bonds and how you can support this transformative initiative: 
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm  
 

Instagram  
Copy: At [Organization Name], we’re proud to support the Baby Bonds initiative—a policy that 
empowers every child in New Mexico with a financial foundation for their future. This innovative 
program can help young adults invest in education, homeownership, or entrepreneurship, 
creating generational change across our state. Let’s work together to make this vision a reality!​
 
Learn more about Baby Bonds and how you can support this transformative initiative using the 
link in our bio.  
 
#BabyBondsNM #NewMexicoBabyBonds #SupportNMBabyBonds  
 

X/Bluesky 
Copy: We're proud to support #BabyBonds—a policy that gives every child in #NewMexico a 
financial foundation for a brighter future! Let’s create generational change together. 💡 Learn 
more & support: https://bit.ly/babybondsnm 
 

Post #4 
IMAGE: BB Logo 3 

Facebook/LinkedIn  
Copy: As a proud supporter of the Baby Bonds initiative, [Organization Name] is excited to 
champion this game-changing program. By providing every child with a financial asset for 
adulthood, Baby Bonds offers a pathway to economic mobility and generational wealth. This is 
about more than policy—it’s about creating a fairer, stronger New Mexico for all. 
 
Find out the latest on the initiative’s progress and how you can support it here: 
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm   

Instagram  
Copy: As a proud supporter of the Baby Bonds initiative, [Organization Name] is excited to 
champion this game-changing program. By providing every child with a financial asset for 

https://bit.ly/babybondsnm
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1ItvjpPCbBeVgJAyiZgA2yKEwO51gZgGM/view?usp=drive_link
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm


 
adulthood, Baby Bonds offers a pathway to economic mobility and generational wealth. This is 
about more than policy—it’s about creating a fairer, stronger New Mexico for all. 
 
Learn more about Baby Bonds and how you can support this transformative initiative using the 
link in our bio. 
 
#BabyBondsNM #NewMexicoBabyBonds #SupportNMBabyBonds  
 

X/Bluesky 
Copy: As a proud supporter of #BabyBonds, [Organization Name] is excited to champion this 
game-changing program for a fairer, stronger NM. 💡 Let’s create pathways to economic 
mobility & generational wealth for all. Learn more & support: https://bit.ly/babybondsnm 
 
 

Post #5 
IMAGE: Opportunity to Thrive 1 

Facebook/LinkedIn  
Copy: Empower New Mexico's future! Baby Bonds give every child the chance to invest in their 
dreams. Let’s make this bold vision a reality. Your voice matters! 🗣️​
 
Learn more about Baby Bonds and stay updated on the initiative here: 
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm​
 

Instagram  
Copy: Empower New Mexico's future! Baby Bonds give every child the chance to invest in their 
dreams. Let’s make this bold vision a reality. Your voice matters! 🗣️​
 
Learn more about Baby Bonds and stay updated on the initiative using the link in our bio! 
 
#BabyBondsNM #NewMexicoBabyBonds #SupportNMBabyBonds  
 

https://bit.ly/babybondsnm
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1gJVEsuVVM88xMnvuYSgXFJonlED3VjJS/view?usp=sharing
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm


 
X/Bluesky 
Copy: Empower #NewMexico's future! #BabyBonds give every child the chance to invest in 
their dreams. Let’s make this bold vision a reality. Your voice matters! 🗣️​
 
Learn more about Baby Bonds and stay updated on the initiative here: 
https://bit.ly/babybondsnm 
 
 

Post #6 
IMAGE: BB Logo 1 

Facebook/LinkedIn  
Copy: Stay in the know about the Baby Bonds initiative! Sign up for our newsletter to get 
updates on the program and its journey through the legislative process. Together, we can create 
opportunities for every child in New Mexico. 🌟 

Subscribe here: https://bit.ly/babybondsnewsletter 

Instagram  
Copy: Stay in the know about the Baby Bonds initiative! Sign up for our newsletter to get 
updates on the program and its journey through the legislative process. Together, we can create 
opportunities for every child in New Mexico. 🌟 
 

Subscribe at bit.ly/babybondsnewsletter or use the link in our bio.  

#BabyBondsNM #NewMexicoBabyBonds #SupportNMBabyBonds  
 

X/Bluesky 
Copy: Stay in the loop on #BabyBonds! Sign up for our newsletter to get the latest updates on 
the initiative and its progress in the legislature. Let’s build a brighter future for every child in 
#NewMexico! 🌟 
 
Subscribe: https://bit.ly/babybondsnewsletter 
 

https://bit.ly/babybondsnm
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1yA9OAWTjPllVKQUX97h24uaEnEcFkUs2/view?usp=sharing
https://bit.ly/babybondsnewsletter
http://bit.ly/babybondsnewsletter
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